

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			LD		Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	H&E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment 2102 E. Slayton Rd. Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000	Texas State Rental 803 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454	HoltCat, LTD 5665 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852	Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219		
1	Trailer Mounted Compressor: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	6	\$34,690.00 \$208,140.00 2021 Sullivan Palatek D260PDKR Kohler 2504 T4F 74hp 12 months. 24 monts air-end H&E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd., San Antonio, TX 78220 60 Days Oct. 31, 2020 Oct. 31, 2020 No	\$37,475.00 \$224,850.00 2020/21 Kaeser M82 Kubota V3307-CR-T 73HP 2yr/2000hr Whichever comes first ASCO Equipment 1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220 120 Days Nov 30/2021 Nov 30/2021 No	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			LD		Non-Local H&E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	Non-Local Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment 2102 E. Slayton Rd. Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000	Non-Local Texas State Rental 803 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454	Local HoltCat, LTD 5665 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852	Local Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity							
2	8,000 lbs. LPG Forklift with Tow Receiver: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	5	No Bid	\$48,399.90 \$241,999.50 2022 Doosan G35S-7 Kubota WG3800 92.5hp 24m/3000hr Factory + Drive train 36m/6000hr + 60m/10,000hr Disc Brake warranty ASCO Equipment 1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220 120 Days Nov 30/2021 Nov 30/2021 No	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			LD		Non-Local H&E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	Non-Local Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment 2102 E. Slayton Rd. Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000	Non-Local Texas State Rental 803 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454	Local HoltCat, LTD 5665 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852	Local Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity							
3	8,000 lbs. LPG Forklift: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	No Bid	\$40,490.10 \$80,980.20 2022 Doosan G35S-7 Kubota WG3800 92.5HP 24m/3000hr Factory + Drive train 36m/6000hr + 60m/10,000hr Disc Brake warranty ASCO Equipment 1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220 180 Days Nov 30/2021 Nov 30/2021 No	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021			Non-Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Local		Local	
For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment			H&E Equipment Services		Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment		Texas State Rental		HoltCat, LTD		Anderson Machinery Company, Inc.	
6100014093			5327 Tex-Con Rd.		2102 E. Slayton Rd.		803 SE Loop 410		5665 SE Loop 410		9415 NE Loop 410	
LD			San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048		Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000		San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454		San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852		San Antonio, TX 78219	
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity										
4	6,000 lb. Pneumatic Tired Forklift LPG: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	No Bid		\$30,902.50 \$61,805.00 2022 Doosan G30N-7LP GCT K25 62.7hp 24m/3000hr Factory + Drive train 36m/6000hr + 60m/10,000hr Disc Brake warranty ASCO Equipment 1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220 180 Days Nov 30/2021 Nov 30/2021 No		\$26,010.67 \$52,021.34 2021 Liugong CLG2030G-3 Kubota 2.5L (43.5 Kw) 3YR/6000 HR Texas State Rentals 803 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78220 60 Days Nov 2021 Nov 30, 2021 Yes		No Bid		No Bid	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			LD		Non-Local H&E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	Non-Local Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment 2102 E. Slayton Rd. Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000	Non-Local Texas State Rental 803 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454	Local HoltCat, LTD 5665 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852	Local Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity							
5	6,000 lb. Rough Terrain Diesel Forklift: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid		\$66,432.00 \$66,432.00 2021/2 CASE 585 H FPT F5HFL463D 74 HP 2yr/2000hr Factory Warranty ASCO Equipment 1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220 180 Days Nov 30/2021 Nov 30/2021 No	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021			Non-Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Local		Local	
For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment			H&E Equipment Services		Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment		Texas State Rental		HoltCat, LTD		Anderson Machinery Company, Inc.	
6100014093			5327 Tex-Con Rd.		2102 E. Slayton Rd.		803 SE Loop 410		5665 SE Loop 410		9415 NE Loop 410	
LD			San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048		Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000		San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454		San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852		San Antonio, TX 78219	
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity										
6	Mini Excavator:	1										
	Price Each:		No Bid		\$39,393.00	\$36,893.67	\$47,163.00	\$47,711.00				
	Total:				\$39,393.00	\$36,893.67	\$47,163.00	\$47,711.00				
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid:						27.83%	29.32%				
	Price Differential:						\$10,269.33	\$10,817.33				
	Year, Make & Model Offered:				2021/22 CASE CX37C	2021 Sany SY35U	2022 Caterpillar 303.5	2022 Kobelco SK30SR-^E w/ Manual Pin Grab Coupler				
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):				Yanmar 3TNV88F-ESHYB	Yanmar 24.4 HP	Cat C.7 @ 23.6 hp	Yanmar 3TNV88F-E 23 HP				
	Warranty:				24m/3000hr Factory warranty	5YR/5000 HR	24 months/2000 hours, total machine	Three (3) Year/3,000 hr (whichever comes first)				
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:				ASCO Equipment	Texas State Rentals	HOLTCAT	Anderson Machinery Company, Inc.				
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:				1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220	803 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78220	5665 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222	9415 NE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78219				
	Delivery:				180 Days	45 Days	150 Days	180-230 Days				
	Production Cut-off Date:				Nov 30/2021	Nov 2021	Unknown at this time	11-30-21				
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:				Nov 30/2021	Nov 30, 2021	Unknown at this time	11-30-21				
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:				No	Yes	Unknown at this time	No				

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021			Non-Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Local		Local	
For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment			H&E Equipment Services		Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment		Texas State Rental		HoltCat, LTD		Anderson Machinery Company, Inc.	
6100014093			5327 Tex-Con Rd.		2102 E. Slayton Rd.		803 SE Loop 410		5665 SE Loop 410		9415 NE Loop 410	
LD			San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048		Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000		San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454		San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852		San Antonio, TX 78219	
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity										
7	Enclosed Wheeled Skid Loader with Attachments: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	\$56,285.00 \$112,570.00	\$45,792.00 \$91,584.00	No Bid		\$51,443.00 \$102,886.00 12.34%	\$66,097.00 \$132,194.00 44.34%	\$11,302.00 2022 Caterpillar 236D3 Cat C3.3B @ 74.3 hp 24 months/2000 hours, total machine	\$40,610.00 2022 GEHL R220 Skidsteer W/ Bucket, Grapple, & Forks Yanmar 4TNV98CT-NMS 70.7 HP Two (2) Year/2,000 hrs (whichever comes first)	HOLTCAT 5665 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 130 Days Unknown at this time Unknown at this time	Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78219 250-280 Days 11-30-21 11-30-21 No

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			LD					
			Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Local	
			H&E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment 2102 E. Slayton Rd. Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000	Texas State Rental 803 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454	HoltCat, LTD 5665 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852	Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219	
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity						
8	Enclosed Wheeled Skid Loader w/ Auger & Breaker: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	\$63,820.00 \$63,820.00 2022 Gehl R220 Yanmar 4TNV98CT-NMS TIER IV 70.7 HP 2 years/2,000 hours H&E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd., San Antonio, TX 78220 210 Days Oct. 31, 2020 Oct. 31, 2020 No	\$50,457.00 \$50,457.00 2022 CASE SR210B FPT F5H FL463 A G001 74HP 24m/2000hr Factory warranty ASCO Equipment 1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220 180 Days Nov 30/2021 Nov 30/2021 No	No Bid	\$56,242.00 \$56,242.00 10.29% \$5,785.00 2022 Caterpillar 236D3 Cat C3.3B @ 74.3 hp 24 months/2000 hours, total machine HOLT CAT 5665 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 130 Days Unknown at this time Unknown at this time Unknown at this time	\$71,356.00 \$71,356.00 41.42% \$20,899.00 2022 GEHL R220 Skidsteer w/ Auger & Hammer Two (2) Year/2,000 hrs (whichever comes first) Two (2) Year/2,000 hrs (whichever comes first) Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78219 250-280 Days 11-30-21 11-30-21 No	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021			Non-Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Local		Local	
For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment			H&E Equipment Services		Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment		Texas State Rental		HoltCat, LTD		Anderson Machinery Company, Inc.	
6100014093			5327 Tex-Con Rd.		2102 E. Slayton Rd.		803 SE Loop 410		5665 SE Loop 410		9415 NE Loop 410	
LD			San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048		Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000		San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454		San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852		San Antonio, TX 78219	
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity										
9	Enclosed Wheeled Skid Loader with Auger:	1										
	Price Each:		\$53,985.00		\$44,652.00		No Bid		\$50,544.00		\$62,227.00	
	Total:		\$53,985.00		\$44,652.00				\$50,544.00		\$62,227.00	
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid:								13.20%		39.36%	
	Price Differential:								\$5,892.00		\$17,575.00	
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2022 Gehl R220		2022 CASE SR210B				2022 Caterpillar 236D3		2022 GEHL R220 Skidsteer w/ Auger	
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):		Yanmar 4TNV98CT-NMS TIER IV 70.7 HP		FPT F5H FL463 A G001, 74HP				Cat C3.3B @ 74.3 hp		Yanmar 4TNV98CT-NMS 70.7 HP	
	Warranty:		2 years/2,000 hours		24m/2000hr Factory warranty				24 months/2000 hours, total machine		Two (2) Year/2,000 hrs (whichever comes first)	
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		H&E Equipment Services		ASCO Equipment				HOLTCAT		Anderson Machinery Company, Inc.	
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		5327 Tex-Con Rd., San Antonio, TX 78220		1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220				5665 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222		9415 NE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78219	
	Delivery:		210 Days		180 Days				130 Days		250-280 Days	
	Production Cut-off Date:		Oct. 31, 2020		Nov 30/2021				Unknown at this time		11-30-21	
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:		Oct. 31, 2020		Nov 30/2021				Unknown at this time		11-30-21	
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No		No				Unknown at this time		No	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021			Non-Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Local		Local	
For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment			H&E Equipment Services		Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment		Texas State Rental		HoltCat, LTD		Anderson Machinery Company, Inc.	
6100014093			5327 Tex-Con Rd.		2102 E. Slayton Rd.		803 SE Loop 410		5665 SE Loop 410		9415 NE Loop 410	
LD			San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048		Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000		San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454		San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852		San Antonio, TX 78219	
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity										
10	Enclosed Wheeled Skid Loader with Breaker: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	\$57,660.00 \$57,660.00	\$47,724.00 \$47,724.00	No Bid	\$56,006.00 \$56,006.00 17.35%	\$69,207.00 \$69,207.00 45.02%	\$8,282.00 2022 Caterpillar 236D3 Cat C3.3B @ 74.3 hp 24 months/2000 hours, total machine HOLTCAT 5665 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 130 Days Unknown at this time Unknown at this time	\$21,483.00 2022 GEHL R220 Skidsteer w/ Hammer Yanmar 4TNV98CT-NMS 70.7 HP Two (2) Year/2,000 hrs (whichever comes first) Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78219 250-280 Days 11-30-21 11-30-21	Unknown at this time	No	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			LD		Non-Local H&E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	Non-Local Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment 2102 E. Slayton Rd. Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000	Non-Local Texas State Rental 803 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454	Local HoltCat, LTD 5665 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852	Local Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219	
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity								
11	Articulated Wheeled Loader with a minimum 4.25 Cubic Yard Bucket: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	4	No Bid	\$231,492.00 \$925,968.00	\$191,869.95 \$767,479.80	\$245,052.00 \$980,208.00 27.72% \$212,728.20	2022 CASE 821G F4HFE613S 230HP 3yr/3000hr Factory	2021 Sany SW405K Deutz TCD7.8 252 HP 5YR/5000 HR Warranty	2022 Caterpillar 950GC Cat C7.1 ACERT 225 net hp 12 months/unlimited hours, total machine	
								ASCO Equipment 1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220	Texas State Rentals 803 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78220	HOLT CAT 5665 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222
				180 Days	75 Days	200 Days				
				Nov 30/2021	December 2021	Unknown at this time				
				Nov 30/2021	Dec 31, 2021	Unknown at this time				
				No	Yes	Unknown at this time				

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			LD		Non-Local H&E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	Non-Local Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment 2102 E. Slayton Rd. Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000	Non-Local Texas State Rental 803 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454	Local HoltCat, LTD 5665 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852	Local Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity							
12	Track Loader/min. 3 CY Bucket: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$310,858.00 \$310,858.00 2022 Caterpillar 963 Cat C7.1 @, 202 hp 12 months/unlimited hours, total machine HOLTCAT 5665 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 150 Days Unknown at this time Unknown at this time Unknown at this time	No Bid		

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			LD		Non-Local H&E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	Non-Local Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment 2102 E. Slayton Rd. Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000	Non-Local Texas State Rental 803 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454	Local HoltCat, LTD 5665 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852	Local Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219	
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity								
13	DELETED:									
14	Tired Pneumatic Roller: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$107,561.00 \$430,244.00 2022 Caterpillar CW16 Cat C3.4B @ 100.5 hp 12 months/unlimited hours, total machine HOLT CAT 5665 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 150 Days Unknown at this time Unknown at this time Unknown at this time	No Bid			

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			LD		Non-Local H&E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	Non-Local Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment 2102 E. Slayton Rd. Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000	Non-Local Texas State Rental 803 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454	Local HoltCat, LTD 5665 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852	Local Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity							
15	Tandem Axle Motor Grader: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	\$181,365.00 \$181,365.00 2022 CASE 836C FPT F4HFE6133 B003 NEF 154HP 36m/3000hr Factory ASCO Equipment 1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220 180 Days Nov 30/2021 Nov 30/2021 No	No Bid	No Bid	\$189,087.00 \$189,087.00 4.26% \$7,722.00 2021 Noram 65ET Full Power Shift Transmission Motorgrader Cummins QSF 3.8 120 HP One (1) Year/1,000 hrs (whichever comes first) Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78219 90-120 Days 11-30-21 11-30-21 No		

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			LD		Non-Local H&E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	Non-Local Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment 2102 E. Slayton Rd. Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000	Non-Local Texas State Rental 803 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454	Local HoltCat, LTD 5665 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852	Local Anderson Machinery Company, Inc. 9415 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity							
16	DELETED:								
17	Loader Backhoe with 24" Bucket: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	\$85,378.00 \$85,378.00 2022 CASE 580N FPT F5BL413C 89HP 24m/2000hr Factory ASCO Equipment 1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220 180 Days Nov 30/2021 Nov 30/2021 No	No Bid	\$96,496.00 \$96,496.00 13.02% \$11,118.00 2022 Caterpillar 416 Cat C3.6 @ 86 hp 12 months/unlimited hours, total machine HOLT CAT 5665 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 150 Days Unknown at this time Unknown at this time Unknown at this time	No Bid		

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021			Non-Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Local		Local	
For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment			H&E Equipment Services		Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment		Texas State Rental		HoltCat, LTD		Anderson Machinery Company, Inc.	
6100014093			5327 Tex-Con Rd.		2102 E. Slayton Rd.		803 SE Loop 410		5665 SE Loop 410		9415 NE Loop 410	
LD			San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048		Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000		San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454		San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852		San Antonio, TX 78219	
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity										
18	Double Drum Vibratory Roller:	2										
	Price Each:		\$127,375.00		\$119,075.00		No Bid		No Bid		\$184,991.00	
	Total:		\$254,750.00		\$238,150.00						\$369,982.00	
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid:										55.36%	
	Price Differential:										\$131,832.00	
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2021 AMMANN ARX110		2022 CASE DV210D						2021 Bomag BW161AD-5	
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):		Deutz TCD 3.6L4 24V 100hp		Deutz 3.6 L4 100HP						Kubota V3800 CR-TI 85 HP	
	Warranty:		2 years/2,000 hours		24m/2000hr Factory						One (1) Year/1,000 hrs (whichever comes first)	
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		H&E Equipment Services		ASCO Equipment						Anderson Machinery Company, Inc.	
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		5327 Tex-Con Rd., San Antonio, TX 78220		1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220						9415 NE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78219	
	Delivery:		90 Days		180 Days						90-120 Days	
	Production Cut-off Date:		Sept. 30, 2020		Nov 30/2021						11-30-21	
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:		Sept. 30, 2020		Nov 30/2021						11-30-21	
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No		No						No	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021			Non-Local		Non-Local		Non-Local		Local		Local	
For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment			H&E Equipment Services		Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment		Texas State Rental		HoltCat, LTD		Anderson Machinery Company, Inc.	
6100014093			5327 Tex-Con Rd.		2102 E. Slayton Rd.		803 SE Loop 410		5665 SE Loop 410		9415 NE Loop 410	
LD			San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048		Lubbock, TX 79404 806-745-2000		San Antonio, TX 78220 512-557-8454		San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-8852		San Antonio, TX 78219	
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity										
19	Padfoot Drum Vibratory Roller :	1										
	Price Each:		\$82,900.00		\$84,472.00		No Bid		\$131,030.00		No Bid	
	Total:		\$82,900.00		\$84,472.00				\$131,030.00			
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid:								36.73%			
	Price Differential:								\$48,130.00			
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2021 AMMANN ARS 70P		2021/2 CASE SV207E 74HP				2022 Caterpillar CP44B			
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):		Kubota V3307-CR-TE5 75hp		Kubota V3307-CR-TE5				Cat C3.4B @ 93.5 hp			
	Warranty:		2 years/2,000 hours		24m/2000hr Factory				12 months/unlimited hours, total machine			
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		H&E Equipment Services		ASCO Equipment				HOLTCAT			
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		5327 Tex-Con Rd., San Antonio, TX 78220		1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220				5665 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222			
	Delivery:		90 Days		180 Days				135 Days			
	Production Cut-off Date:		Sept. 30, 2020		Nov 30/2021				Unknown at this time			
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:		Sept. 30, 2020		Nov 30/2021				Unknown at this time			
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No		No				Unknown at this time			
	Payment Terms:		Net 30		Net 30		Net 30		Net 30		Net 30	
	Estimated Annual Total:		\$833,825.00		\$2,465,209.70		\$856,394.81		\$2,261,677.00		\$941,764.00	
	Estimated Annual Award:		\$291,040.00		\$1,128,721.70		\$856,394.81		\$741,102.00			

Deleted: Item 13 will not be re-bid, Item 16 will be re-bid at a later date.

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Non-Local	Withdrew Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
1	Trailer Mounted Compressor: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	6	NAS \$33,498.00 \$200,988.00 2022 Doosan P250/MHP185WDO- T4F Engine - Doosan D24 / 74 HP 1YR / 3,000 PACKAGE... 2YRS/4,000 HOURS AIREND... 2YRS/4,000 HOURS ENGINE Central Texas Equipment 1401 Central Commerce Cir. Pflugerville, TX 78660 196 Days Aug 31 2022 Aug 31 2022 Not Provided	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Non-Local	Withdrew Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
			Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity						
2	8,000 lbs. LPG Forklift with Tow Receiver: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	5	No Bid	\$44,266.27 \$221,331.35 Doosan 2021 G35S-7 Kubota WG3800 92.5hp 1 Year/ 2000 hours standard, 2 year/ 4000 hours drive train, 5 year/ 10,000 hours Disk Brake Associated Supply Company 1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220 140 Days 10/01/2021 Not Provided Yes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Non-Local	Withdrew Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
			Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity						
3	8,000 lbs. LPG Forklift: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	No Bid	\$39,038.31 \$78,076.62 2021 Doosan G35S-7 Kubota WG3800 92.5HP 1 Year/ 2000 hours standard, 2 year/ 4000 hours drive train, 5 year/ 10,000 hours Disk Brake Associated Supply Company 1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220 140 Days 10/01/2021 Not Provided Yes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Non-Local	Withdrew Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
			Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity						
4	6,000 lb. Pneumatic Tired Forklift LPG: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	No Bid	\$25,310.62 \$50,621.24 2021 Doosan G30N-7 Nissan GCT K25 62.7HP 1 Year/ 2000 hours standard, 2 year/ 4000 hours drive train, 5 year/ 10,000 hours Disk Brake Associated Supply Company 1920 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78220 140 Days 10/01/2021 Not Provided Yes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			LD						
			Non-Local Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Withdrew Non-Local Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Non-Local Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	Non-Local RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Non-Local Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Local Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222	
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity							
5	6,000 lb. Rough Terrain Diesel Forklift: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Non-Local	Withdrew Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
6	Mini Excavator: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	\$37,016.42 \$37,016.42 2021 Bobcat E32 Compact Excavator Bobcat D1703 24.8 HP Diesel Engine 2 Year or 2000 hours of use, whichever occurs first Bobcat of San Antonio 11146 I.H. North, San Antonio, TX 78233 90-120 days Nov 1 - Model year ends, However no characteristics or specification changes. Only model year tag on unit changes Oct 15 Yes	No Bid	No Bid	\$44,565.00 \$44,565.00 2021 John Deere 35G Yanmar 4TNV88F (23.3HP) 2 Year or 2000 hours RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132 180 Days 11/30/2021 11/30/2021 No	\$40,319.22 \$40,319.22 2021 John Deere 35G Yanmar 3TNV88F (23.3HP) Two-Year/2,000-Hour Full Machine Tellus Equipment Solutions-San Antonio 8587 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250 60 Days Nov 30th Nov 30th Yes	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			LD		Non-Local Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Withdrew Non-Local Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Non-Local Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	Non-Local RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Non-Local Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Local Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity								
7	Enclosed Wheeled Skid Loader with Attachments: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$48,885.00	\$47,203.31	No Bid	2021 John Deere 320G Yanmar 4TNV98C (69HP) 2 Year or 2000 hours RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132 180 Days 11/30/2021 11/30/2021 No	2021 John Deere 320G Yanmar 4TNV98CT (69) Two-Year/2,000-Hour Tellus Equipment Solutions-San Antonio 8587 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250 60 Days Nov 30th Nov 30th Yes

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Non-Local	Withdraw Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
8	Enclosed Wheeled Skid Loader w/ Auger & Breaker: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,620.00 \$56,620.00 2021 John Deere 320G Yanmar 4TNV98C (69HP) 2 Year or 2000 hours RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132 180 Days 11/30/2021 11/30/2021 No	\$53,136.03 \$53,136.03 2021 John Deere 320G Yanmar 4TN98CT (69 HP) Two-Year/2,000-Hour Tellus Equipment Solutions-San Antonio 8587 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250 60 Days Nov 30th Nov 30th Yes	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Non-Local	Withdrew Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
9	Enclosed Wheeled Skid Loader with Auger: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$49,860.00 \$49,860.00 2021 John Deere 320G Yanmar 4TNV98C (69HP) 2 Year or 2000 hours	\$46,944.60 \$46,944.60 2021 John Deere 320G Yanmar 4TNV98CT Two-Year/2,000-Hour Full Machine	No Bid
						RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132 180 Days 11/30/2021 11/30/2021 No	Tellus Equipment Solutions 8587 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250 60 Days Nov 30th Nov 30th Yes	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Non-Local	Withdrew Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
10	Enclosed Wheeled Skid Loader with Breaker: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$52,795.00 \$52,795.00 2021 John Deere 320G Yanmar 4TNV98C (69HP) 2 Year or 2000 hours RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132 180 Days 11/30/2021 11/30/2021 No	\$50,717.47 \$50,717.47 2021 John Deere 320G Yanmar 4TNV98CT Two-Year/2,000-Hour Full Machine Tellus Equipment Solutions 8587 Bandera Rd., San Antonio, TX 78250 60 Days Nov 30th Nov 30th Yes	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Non-Local	Withdrew Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
11	Articulated Wheeled Loader with a minimum 4.25 Cubic Yard Bucket: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$199,885.00 \$799,540.00	\$225,900.00 \$903,600.00	No Bid	\$239,335.00 \$957,340.00 24.74% \$189,860.20 2021 Komatsu WA380-8 Komatsu SAA6D107E- 3 191 HP 1 Yr/Unlimited Hourmeter Hours Whichever Occurs First Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 120 Days 9/30/2021 9/30/2021 No

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Non-Local	Withdrew Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
12	Track Loader/min. 3 CY Bucket: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$347,125.00 \$347,125.00 2021 John Deere 755K John Deere Power Tech PVS 6068 (194 HP) 1 Year Unlimited Hours RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132 180 Days 11/30/2021 11/30/2021 No	No Bid	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			LD		Non-Local Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Withdrew Non-Local Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Non-Local Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	Non-Local RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Non-Local Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Local Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity								
13	DELETED:									
14	Tired Pneumatic Roller: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Withdrew Non-Local					
LD			Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
			Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity						
15	Tandem Axle Motor Grader: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Non-Local	Withdrew Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
16	DELETED:							
17	Loader Backhoe with 24" Bucket: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$89,880.00 \$89,880.00 2021 John Deere 310L John Deere Power Tech 4045HL050 turbocharged (100 HP) 1 Year Unlimited Hours RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132 180 Days 11/30/2021 11/30/2021 No	No Bid	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Non-Local	Withdrew Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
18	Double Drum Vibratory Roller: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$137,500.00 \$275,000.00 2021-2022 Hamm HD90VVHF Deutz TCD 3.6 L4 1 yr / 1000 hours Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 N, Converse, TX 78109 250 Days Nov 30, 2021 Nov 30, 2021 No	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2021 For: Annual Contract for Off Road Equipment 6100014093			Non-Local	Withdrew Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
Item	Description	Estimated Annual Quantity	Clark Equipment Company 250 East Beaton Drive West Fargo, ND 58078	Doosan Industrial Vehicles American Corp. 2475 Mill Center Pkwy, Suite 400 Buford, GA 30518	Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35 New Braunfels, TX 78132	Tellus Equipment Solutions 2002 West Grand Parkway N., Katy, TX 77449	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222
19	Padfoot Drum Vibratory Roller : Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Payment Terms: Estimated Annual Total:	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$97,675.00 \$97,675.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$115,500.00 \$115,500.00 39.32% \$32,600.00 2021 Bomag BW117PDH-5 Kubota V3307-CR-T 75HP 1 Yr/Unlimited Hourmeter Hours Whichever Occurs First Waukesha-Pearce Industries, LLC 3740 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 90 Days 9/30/2021 9/30/2021 No Net 30 \$1,072,840.00
	Estimated Annual Award:		\$238,004.42	\$350,029.21	\$1,172,215.00	\$1,642,215.00	\$285,523.94	\$1,072,840.00

Deleted: Item 13 will not be re-bid, Item 16 will be re-bid at a later date.